COUNTY OF ERIE

MARK C. POLANCARZ
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

DIVISION OF PURCHASE

TO: ALL USING DEPARTMENTS
FROM: Denyse Insalaco-Weatherbee, Buyer
DATE: September 11, 2012

SUBJECT: ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS & WINDSHIELD WASHER
CONTRACT #212230-004 — Extension through December 31, 2012

This is to advise you that the contract for ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS & WINDSHIELD
WASHER has been extended through December 31, 2012. The successful bidders are Noco and Superior
Lubricants. Superior Lubricant has agreed to hold their pricing through December 31, 2012. NOCO’s pricing
was good for six months.

For your convenience | have listed the pricing information on the attached sheets.
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ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER
BID NO.: 212230-004
CONTRACT TERM:

COMMODITY CODE: 060, 405A

VENDOR INFORMATION: NOCO DISTRIBUTION LLC
VENDOR #110707
2440 SHERIDAN DRIVE
TONAWANDA, NY 14150
TELEPHONE #614-1244
Minimum Order: None

SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS COMPANY, INC. —
VENDOR #108483

32 WARD ROAD

NORTH TONAWANDA, NEW YORK 14120
TELEPHONE 716-693-8412

FAX 716-695-9087

Minimum Order: 1 Case or 1 Drum



ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER

BID NO.: 212230-004

CONTRACT TERM: July 1, 2012 — December 31, 2012 — Superior
July 1, 2012 - December 31, 2012 - NOCO

COMMODITY CODE: 060, 405A

I. PERMANENT ANTIFREEZE — LOW SILICATE FORMULA:
55 Gallon Drum NOCO Premium NOC235308 $393.80/55 Gallon Drum

Case (6-1 Gallon) Old World Full Force ATF61 $43.14/Case
Gallon Old World Full Force ATF61 $7.19/Gallon
Drum Deposit: Zero

II. PERMANENT ANTI-SILICATE - HIGH SILICATE FORMULA:

55 Gallon Drum NOCO Premium NOC23538 $393.80/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon) Old World Full Force ATF61 $43.14/Case

Gallon Old World Full Force ATF61 $7.19/Gallon

Drum Deposit: Zero

I11. NON-PERMANENT ANTIFREEZE:

55 Gallon Drum Peak RV Alf $264.00/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon)  Peak RV Alf $31.50/Case

Gallon Peak RV Alf $5.25/Gallon

Drum Deposit: $20.00

V. ROAD KING ANTIFREEZE - CONTAINS NO OIL*NO SUBSTITUTIONS!

55 Gallon Drum  Road King “Green” $442.20/55 Gallon Drum
Case(6-1Gallon)  Peak Full Force $49.68/Case

Gallon Peak Full Force $8.28/Gallon

Drum Deposit: $20.00

V. GM DEX-COOL ROAD KING GOLD UNIVERSAL LIFETIME

55 Gallon Drum Road King “Gold” Ext. Life $442.20/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon)  Peak Global Ext. Life $59.70/Case
Gallon Peak Full Force $8.28/Gallon

Drum Deposit $20.00
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ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER

BID NO.: 212230-004

CONTRACT TERM: July 1, 2012 — December 31, 2012 — Superior
July 1, 2012 - December 31, 2012 - NOCO

COMMODITY CODE: 060, 405A

VI ANTIFREEZE 50/50 PREDILUTED EXTENDED LIFE
Coolant -34° to 265° Fare height (Product 16709-SS/F)
Must be pink or red for 2010 or newer vehicles

55 Gallon Drum Old WorldFlch505Premix08 $255.75/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon)  Old WorldFleetcharge505061 $29.28/Case

Gallon Old WorldFleetcharge505061 $4.88/Gallon

Drum Deposit Zero

VIl ANTIFREEZE EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT PART #10-101
55 Gallon Drum Old WorldFinalchahdexI505008 $427.90/55 Gallon Drum

Case (6-1 Gallon)  OIld WorldFinalchhdexI505061 $48.28/Case
Gallon Old WorldFinalchhdexI505061 $8.04/Gallon
Drum Deposit Zero

VIl ANTIFREEZE PEAK THERMO GUARD:

55 Gallon Drum  Peak Thermo Guard $501.05/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon) No Bid
Gallon No Bid
Drum Deposit $20.00

IX. PEAK GLOBAL LIFETIME ANTIFREEZE:

55 Gallon Drum Old World PeakGlobal505008 $349.25/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon)  OIld World Peak Global505061 $39.60/Case

Gallon Old World Peak Global 505061 $6.60/Gallon

Drum Deposit Zero

X. ANTIFREEZE UNIVERSAL GREEN:
Gallon Old World Ffllap61 $8.13/Gallon
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XI. WINDSHIELD WASHER SOLUTION PREMIX RATIO 3 PARTS WATER TO 1 PART

SOLUTION:

55 Gallon Drum Tuxton-20° $77.55/55 Gallon Drum
Case (6-1 Gallon)  Camco-20° $9.84/Case

Gallon Camco-20° $1.64/Gallon

Drum Deposit $20.00
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ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER

BID NO.: 212230-004

CONTRACT TERM: July 1, 2012 — December 31, 2012 — Superior
July 1, 2012 - December 31, 2012 - NOCO

COMMODITY CODE: 060, 405A

XII. DRY GAS:
CASE - 12 OZ. CONTAINERS  Heet $22.73/Case NOCO-6

X111, PROPYLENE GLYCOL INTERCOOL P-30050/50
55 Gallon Drum NOCO, Propylene Glycol 50/50 $455.95/55 Gallon Drum NOCO-6

Case/6-1 Gallon No Bid
Gallon No Bid
Drum Deposit Zero NOCO-6

XI1V. PROPYLENE GLYCOLP —300100

55 Gallon Drum NOCO Propylene Glycol P300 $838.20/55 Gallon Drum NOCO-6
Case/6-1 Gallon No Bid

Gallon No Bid

Drum Deposit Zero NOCO-6




