
 

 
COUNTY OF ERIE 

 

MARK C. POLONCARZ 

COUNTY EXECUTIVE 
 

DIVISION OF PURCHASE 
 

                                    

TO:    ALL USING DEPARTMENTS 

 

FROM:            Lorraine Kolb, Buyer 

 

DATE:   June 27, 2014 

 

SUBJECT: ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS & WINDSHIELD WASHER 

                        CONTRACT #214009-004  

 

 

This is to advise you that the contract for “ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD 

WASHER” has been EXTENDED .  The term is for an additional six-month period, 7-1-14 through 12-31-14.  

All prices from the three vendors are good for six months.  The vendors on this contract include Deckman Oil, 

Noco Distribution and Superior Lubricant. 

 

For your convenience I have listed the pricing information on the attached sheets.   

 

lmk 

Attachment 
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ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER 

BID NO.: 214009-004 

CONTRACT TERM:  July 1, 2014 – December 31, 2014  

                                           

COMMODITY CODE:  060, 405A 

 

VENDOR INFORMATION:            DECKMAN OIL 

                                                            Vendor #139277 

                                                            9 Norton Street 

                                                            Honeye Falls, NY 14472 

                                                            Telephone #800-836-0562 

                                                             Fax #585-624-2142 

                                                             Minimum Order: None 

 

 

     NOCO DISTRIBUTION LLC 

     Vendor #110707 

     2440 Sheridan Drive 

     Tonawanda, NY 14150 

     Telephone #614-1244 

                                                             Fax #874-7032 

                                                            Minimum Order: None 

 

 

SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS COMPANY, INC. 

                                                Vendor #108483 

     32 Ward Road 

     North Tonawanda, NY 14120 

     Telephone #693-8412 

                                                          Fax #695-9087        

                                                            Minimum Order: 1 Drum or 6 Cases 
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ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER 

BID NO.: 214009-004 

CONTRACT TERM:  July 1, 2014 – December 31, 2014                                             

COMMODITY CODE:  060, 405A 

 

I.  PERMANENT ANTIFREEZE – LOW SILICATE FORMULA: 

55 Gallon Drum   Valvoline-Zerex Original Green     $416.35/55 Gallon Drum   Deckman Oil 

Case (6-1 Gallon)        Valvoline-Zerex Original Green     $47.22/Case                        Deckman Oil 

Gallon                          Valvoline-Zerex Original Green     $7.87/Gallon                        Deckman Oil 

Drum Deposit:                  $20.00             Deckman Oil 

 

II. PERMANENT  - HIGH SILICATE FORMULA: 

55 Gallon Drum  Valvoline-Zerex Original Green     $416.35/55 Gallon Drum     Deckman Oil 

Case (6-1 Gallon)       Valvoline-Zerex Original Green     $47.22/Case                         Deckman Oil 

Gallon                          Valvoline-Zerex Original Green    $7.87/Gallon                         Deckman Oil 

Drum Deposit:                            $20.00                          Deckman Oil 

 

III. NON-PERMANENT ANTIFREEZE: 

55 Gallon Drum        Peak RV Alf                $234.85/55 Gallon Drum Superior 

Case (6-1 Gallon)      Peak RV Alf     $26.40/Case   Superior 

Gallon   Peak RV Alf     $4.40/Gallon   Superior 

Drum Deposit:       $20.00   Superior 

 

IV. ROAD KING ANTIFREEZE - CONTAINS NO OIL*NO SUBSTITUTIONS! 

55 Gallon Drum       Road King “Green” Alf                     $466.95/55 Gallon Drum Superior 

Case(6-1Gallon)       Peak Full Force                                   $52.50/Case   Superior 

Gallon                       Peak Full Force                                   $8.76/Gallon                          Superior          

Drum Deposit:                             $20.00                                    Superior 

           

V.  GM DEX-COOL ROAD KING GOLD UNIVERSAL LIFETIME 

55 Gallon Drum        Road King “Gold” Ext. Life            $437.25/55 Gallon Drum Superior 

Case (6-1 Gallon)      Peak Global Ext. Life                        $64.80/Case      Superior 

Gallon                        Peak Full Force                                  $10.80/Gallon              Superior 

Drum Deposit                                                                          $20.00                                   Superior 

 

VI. ANTIFREEZE 50/50 PREDILUTED EXTENDED LIFE 

Coolant -34° to 265° Fare height (Product 16709-SS/F)  

Must be pink or red for 2010 or newer vehicles    

55 Gallon Drum Road King Grimson HD E.L. 50/50   $251.90/55 Gallon Drum     Superior 

Case (6-1 Gallon) Old World Fleet Charge                     $33.42/Case                  NOCO 

Gallon                        Old World Fleet Charge                     $5.57/Gallon          NOCO 

Drum Deposit         Zero                  NOCO         

                                                                                                   $20.00      Superior 
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ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, DRY GAS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER 

BID NO.: 214009-004 

CONTRACT TERM: July 1, 2014 – December 31, 2014                                            

COMMODITY CODE:  060, 405A        

                                         

VII  ANTIFREEZE EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT PART #10-101            

55 Gallon Drum       Road King Crimson HD      $437.25/55 Gallon Drum    Superior 

Case (6-1 Gallon)     Old World Final Charge HD5050       $47.52/Case                    NOCO 

Gallon                       Old World Final Charge HD5050       $7.92/Gallon                NOCO 

Drum Deposit         $20.00                                     Superior 

                                                                                                   Zero                  NOCO         

 

VIII    ANTIFREEZE PEAK THERMO GUARD:            

55 Gallon Drum       Peak Thermo Guard      $485.65/55 Gallon Drum     Superior 

Case (6-1 Gallon)                                                                      No Bid 

Gallon                              No Bid 

Drum Deposit          $20.00        Superior     

                                     

IX. PEAK GLOBAL LIFETIME ANTIFREEZE: 

55 Gallon Drum  Old World Peak Global                 $374.55/55 Gallon Drum        NOCO 

Case (6-1 Gallon)       Old World Peak Global505061          $39.9041.82/Case                    NOCO 

Gallon    Old World Peak Global 505061         $6.65/Gallon                           NOCO 

Drum Deposit          Zero       NOCO 
 

X. ANTIFREEZE UNIVERSAL GREEN: 

Gallon     Peak Full Force      $8.76/Gallon       Superior 
 

XI. WINDSHIELD WASHER SOLUTION PREMIX  RATIO 3 PARTS WATER TO 1 PART 

SOLUTION: 

55 Gallon Drum SPS-RTU -20 (27% Methanol)         $85.25/55 Gallon Drum            Deckman Oil 

Case (6-1 Gallon) Peak Pre-Mix w/w -20°   $11.40/Case        Superior 

Gallon                        Peak Pre-Mix w/w -20°   $1.90/Gallon                              Superior 

Drum Deposit       $20.00                                         Deckman Oil 

                                                                                                 $20.00                                         Superior 

XII. DRY GAS: 

Case–24/12 oz. Containers Cristy                $33.12/Case                              Superior 

                                                                                              

 

XIII. PROPYLENE GLYCOL INTERCOOL P-300 50/50                    

55 Gallon Drum         SPS Propylene Glycol 50/50            $420.75/55 Gallon Drum           Deckman Oil 

Case/6-1 Gallon                                                                      No Bid 

Gallon                                                                                      No Bid 

Drum Deposit        $20.00                   Deckman Oil        

       

 

XIV.   PROPYLENE GLYCOLP – 300 100 

55 Gallon Drum          Intercool P-300                                    $783.75/55 Gallon Drum       Superior 

Case/6-1 Gallon                                                                        No Bid 

Gallon                                                                             No Bid 

Drum Deposit                                                                           $20.00                                       Superior               

                      

 


