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Grant, Betty

From; Patricia Connolly [patsycons@yahoo.com]

Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 9:34 PM -
To: Grant, Betty sz
Subject: Fw: SHPO Grant News!! .

Attachments: 406050-Appendix X.doc

Hi Betty Jean--

Here is the |latest news from the Botanical Gardens. This email is from Miche Needham who is
the president of the Board of Directors.

Pat Connolly

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Miche C. Needham <MNeedham@Ilumsdencpa.com>

To: Miche C. Needham <MNeedham@lumsdencpa.com>; Julie DeCarolis <jmccarthy@buffalogardens.com=;’
Philip J. Synder’ <psnyder@stieglitzsnyder.com=>; 'Adam Poocle' <Adam.Poole@Freedmaxick.com>; 'Barbara
Tomasi' <bbtomasi@hotmail.com=>; 'Bryan Debroka' <bdebroka@yahoo.com>; 'Bryan Debroka'
<bryan.r.debroka@us.hsbc.com>; 'CJ Uraub' <CJUrlaub@chsbuffalo.org>; "Claire Schen, Ph.D."
<claire.schen@gmail.com>; 'Ed Dore' <eddore@dorelandscape.com>; 'Elizabeth Licata’'
<elicata@buffalospree.com>; 'Elizabeth Moll' <ElizabethaMoll@yahoo.com>; 'Gail McGee'
<NYDistrict8@aol.com>; 'Gordon Ballard' <gordo@adstuff.com>; ‘Joe DiDomenico'
<jdidomenico@roadrunner.com>; 'Joy Kuebler' <jkuebler@JKLAstudio.com>; ‘Kathy Balus'
<KMBALUS@gmail.com>; 'Kathy Guest Shadrack' <irisborer@aol.com>; 'Kgray(CJ's assistant)’
<Kgray@chsbuffalo.org>; 'Larry Christ' <ChristL@litelab.com>; 'Nick Baich' <nickbaich@yahoo.com>; 'Pat
Connolly ' <patsycons@yahoo.com>; 'Peter Muth' <pmuth@roadrunner.com>; “"Richard F. Griffin, Esg."”
<rgriffin@kavinockycook.com>; ‘Sara Root' <srcot@mower.com>; 'Stephanie M. Karnas'
<SMKarnas@gmail.com=>; ‘Thomas Herman' <THERMAN@PIONEERCSD .org>; 'Thomas Herrera-Mishler'
<thmishler@bfloparks.org>

Cc: "dswarts@buffalogardens.com" <dswaris@buffalogardens.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 26, 2012 5:29 PM

Subject: SHPO Grant Newsl!

As reported in Dave’s email below, SHPO has approved an extension to the grant which will allow the
county to move forward on the restoration of the foundations in houses 2 & 3. While this is great news,
it is only for the foundation work. Half of the estimated cost ts $60,000 and the Gardens will pay the
other $60,000. We have essentially fost the remaining $140,000 that was a modification to the grant to
apply towards the overall restoration of houses 2 & 3.

"Dave, thank you for your efforts in writing the letter for the extension and sending to Mr. Poloncarz for
his signature, otherwise we would have lost the entire grant! Now, let’s get those foundations restored.

Miche C. Needham, CPA

Tax Principal

Lumsden & Mc¢cCormick, LLP

403 Main Street, Suite 430

Buffalo, New York 14203

(T) 716-836-3300 x157

(F) 716-852-2499

mneedham@lumsdencpa.com -t

5/3/2012



APPENDIX X-MODIFICATION AGREEMENT FORM

Period From: October 20, 2006 to December 31, 2010 Agency Code: 49070
To: October 20, 2006 to July 31, 2012 Project #: EPF-406050-N5
Contract #: C406050

Funding Amount for Period: $200,000.00

This is an AGREEMENT between THE STATE OF NEW YORK, acting by and through the Office of Parks,
Recreation and Historic Preservation, having its principal office at Albany, New York 12238 (hereinafter referred to
as the STATE), and the County of Erie, having its principal office at 95 Franklin Street, Buffalo, New York
14202 (hereinafter referred to as the CONTRACTORY), for modification of Contract Number C406050, as amended
in this Appendix.

All other provisions of said AGREEMENT shall remain in full force and effect.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this AGREEMENT as of the dates appearing under
their signatures.

CONTRACTOR: STATE AGENCY:

County of Erie New York State Office of Parks, Recreation and Historic
Preservation

By: By:

Printed Name: Date:

Printed Title: State Agency Certification:

"In addition to the acceptance of this contract, | also
certify that original copies of this signature page will

Date: be attached to all other exact copies of this contract.”
STATE OF NEW YORK )
) SS:
COUNTY of )
On the day of in the year , before me, the undersigned, personally appeared

, personally known to me or proved to me on the basis of
satisfactory evidence to be the individual(s} whose name(s) is (are) subscribed to the within instrument and
acknowledged to me that he/shefthey executed the same in his/her/their capacity (ies), and that by his/her/their
signature(s) on the instrument, the individual(s), or the person upon behalf of which the individual(s) acted,
executed the instrument.

(Notary Public, State of New York)
ATTORNEY GENERAL: Approved:

Thomas P. DiNapoli
State Comptroller

By
Date




